AUSTIN COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT BID TABULATION

VENDOR A

Classic Printers

NAME:

Dept./Campus: Service Center

IFB Number: 966-08039VJ

ADDRESS:

7812 Kempwood

Page 1 of 2___pages

CITY, STATE, ZIP:

Houston, Texas 77055

Date Prepared: 09/04/08

TELEPHONE: 713-863-0158 CONTACT: John E. Kemp, Sales

Prepared By: Vickie Johnson

NAME: Mira Digital Publishing Notes: Reviewed by Rodney Wheeler
ADDRESS: 3800 Park Avenue
CITY, STATE, ZIP: St. Louis, MO 63110
TELEPHONE: 866-341-9588 CONTACT: Jill Frye, National Acct. Manager
NAME: Capital Printing
ADDRESS: 4001 Caven Road
CITY, STATE, ZIP: Austin, TX 78744
TELEPHONE: 512-442-1415 CONTACT: Karen Sebens, Print Consultant
Use Reverse Side If Needed DOR A DOR B DOR
ITEM# | QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
1 1 lot [Printing of 450 (+ 50 extra covers) ;100 page literary journal $3,449.00 $10,326.66
2 1 ea [Additional Services: printing of +4 additional pages $0.16 $66.00
3 1 ea |Less: minus 4 pages $0.16 $133.00
4 1 ea |Option 2.5.1 $9.40 No Bid
5 1 ea |Option 2.5.2 $18.80 No Bid
6
Total: $3,449.00 $10,326.66
Discount: $0.00 $0.00
Subtotal: $3,449.00 $10,326.66
*Shipping: $450.00 $0.00
Grand Total: NO BID $3,899.00 $10,326.66




AUSTIN COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT BID TABULATION

VENDOR D

Dept./Campus: Service Center

NAME: Morgan Printing, DBA of L&M Bookworks,Inc. IFB Number: 966-08039VJ
ADDRESS: 900 Old Koenig Ln., Ste 135 Page 2 of 2 pages
CITY, STATE, ZIP: Austin, Texas 78756 Date Prepared: 09/04/08
TELEPHONE: 512-459-5194 CONTACT: Mark Hillis, President
NAME: Ginny's Printing Notes: Reviewed by Rodney Wheeler
ADDRESS: 8410-B Tuscany Way
CITY, STATE, ZIP: Austin, Texas 78754
TELEPHONE: 512-483-6101 CONTACT: Eric Fisher, Acct Manaier
NAME: Alphagraphics
ADDRESS:
CITY, STATE, ZIP:
TELEPHONE: 512-263-7572 CONTACT: Nathan Mendenhall, Owner
Use Reverse Side If Needed DOR D DOR DOR
ITEM# | QUANTITY [UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
1 1 lot |Printing of 450 (+ 50 extra covers) ;100 page literary journal $2,930.00 $8,023.38
2 1 ea |Additional Services: printing of +4 additional pages $32.00 $1,251.73
3 1 ea |Less: minus 4 pages $32.00 $1,253.73
4 1 ea |Option 2.5.1 $446.00 No Bid
5 1 ea |Option 2.5.2 $892.00 No Bid
Total: $2,930.00 $8,023.38
Discount: $0.00 $0.00
Subtotal: $2,930.00 $8,023.38
*Shipping: $0.00 $0.00
Grand Total: $2,930.00 $8,023.38 NO BID
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