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Omni Austin - Southpark

Bid Tabulation
IFB # 971-09031CC Special Events Catering & Room Rental - General Assembly 2009

PAGE ONE OF TWO

Name
Bid Type (check one) Bidder Information

Austin, TX 78701 Austin, TX 78759 Lost Pines, TX 78612
Address 208 Barton Springs 500 East 4th Street 9721 Arboretum Blvd. 575 Hyatt Lost Pines Road

Sheraton Austin - Downtown
Embassy Suites - Austin Central

Sole/Single Source Email address:  jbusby@hyatt.com jyll.vertuno@hilton.com marilyn.eckhardt@renaissancehotels.com liz.sansom@hyatt.com

City, State, ZIP Austin, TX 78704
Competitive POC

512-682-2718 512-308-1234 NO BIDTelephone # 512-480-2046 512-795-6013

Item

Continental Breakfast Selection

Purchase Order

385.00$                385.00$                
Description of Supplies/Services Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

ea Table Rental (20 - 25 tables)  (Maximum $300) 300.00$                       

Unit Price Amount
1 1 ea Table Rental (20 -25 tables) (20x$15.00 + $85 Electric) -$                             -$                                                 -$                        -$                     

Unit Price AmountUnit Price Amount

-$                             -$                             -$                      -$                      -$                     
-$                      300.00$                       -$                      -$                                                 

1b 1 ea Table Rental (20 - 25 tables)  (Maximum $300) - No Charge*
-$                  -$                        -$                     1a 1

3,000.00$                                        -$                  
2a 1 ea Room Rental (Waived with $9,000 F&B minimum)** -$                             
2

4 700 ea Catering per person:  CONTINENTAL BREAKFAST 17.00$                         11,900.00$                  16.00$                  

-$                             

11,200.00$          19.50$                 13,650.00$                                      18.00$                    
1,506.00$            

-$                        
2,750.00$               1,506.00$            

5a 700 ea Parking per vehicle (Discounted)  -$                     -$                                                 3 00$                           2 100 00$                    -$                      -$                      -$                        -$                  

3,000.00$            1 ea Room Rental 5,000.00$                    

3 1 ea Stage, Podium and A/V Serrvices 585.00$                       

 Hyatt Regency - Austin

410.00$                                           
-$                      -$                      -$                     -$                                                 

585.00$                       410.00$               

-$                                                 

-$                             

5
Hilton - Austin Renaissance Austin Hotel Hyatt Regency Lost Pines Resort Doubletree Austin

5,000.00$                    

1 2 3 4

2,750.00$         
-$                  

1,000.00$            1,000.00$            

BPO
Contract

Embassy Suites - Town Lake

Written
Verbal

Contract Type (check one) GENERAL ASSEMBLY 2009

Qty Unit

-$                        

-$                  

12,600.00$       

-$                        -$                  

Parking per vehicle 5.00$                    3,500.00$            5 700 ea

Buyer Name:

-$                        
Labor or Special Handling Charges (Stairs, inside Del, etc)
Transportation

5a 700 ea Parking per vehicle (Discounted)  -$                     -$                                                 

 *No Charge for Tables
**Rental Waived with Minimum (Food $18K) 

 *No Charge for Tables
**Rental Waived with Minimum
Self-Parking (Lot Limit = 500) 

3.00$                           2,100.00$                    -$                      -$                      -$                        

4,175.85$                    4,175.85$                    -$                      

-$                  

-$                  

-$                     -$                                                 3,223.50$         
6a 1 ea Service Charge - 22% -$                             
6

-$                        -$                  

-$                     -$                                                 -$                        -$                  -$                             -$                             
-$                             -$                             -$                      -$                      -$                     -$                                                 -$                        -$                  

-$                                                 -$                  

GRAND TOTAL 24,060.85$                  21,461.02$          20,813.20$                                      18,573.50$       

Recommend Award to:
Date Order Placed

-$                      -$                      

19,885.00$                  

-$                             

1 ea Service Charge - 21% 

-$                             
-$                             

-$                      -$                      

3,223.50$               

-$                        

-$                      
3,870.02$            3,753.20$            3,753.20$                                        

-$                      

17,591.00$          

-$                     -$                                                 
3,870.02$            

Carol Crader

(Bid Tab must be approved by 
Purchasing Manager if award is 
made to other than low bidder or 

is a single source award)

Date: 4/30/09

Contract Type  and        
Contract Number: PO

Approved By (Typed 
Name and signature): Reed Stoddard, Purchasing Manager

      

17,060.00$                                      15,350.00$       SUBTOTAL

Bid Tab IFB #971-09031CC Rev2A-General Assembly.xls
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27.00$                   

-$                                             -$                      -$                 

Bid Tabulation
IFB # 971-09031CC Special Events Catering & Room Rental - General Assembly 2009

PAGE TWO OF TWO

Bid Type (check one) Bidder Information 1 2 3 4 5

575 Hyatt Lost Pines Road Omni Austin - Southpark
Name  Hyatt Regency - Austin Hilton - Austin Renaissance Austin Hotel Hyatt Regency Lost Pines Resort

Austin, TX 78704 Austin, TX 78701 Austin, TX 78759 Lost Pines, TX 78612

Doubletree Austin
Written Address 208 Barton Springs 500 East 4th Street 9721 Arboretum Blvd.

Sheraton Austin - Downtown
Competitive POC Embassy Suites - Austin Central
Verbal City, State, ZIP

NO BID
Sole/Single Source Email address:  jbusby@hyatt.com jyll.vertuno@hilton.com marilyn.eckhardt@renaissancehotels.com liz.sansom@hyatt.com

Telephone # 512-480-2046 512-682-2705 512-795-6013 512-308-1234

Contract Type (check one) GENERAL ASSEMBLY 2009

BPO
Breakfast Buffet Selection

Contract

Embassy Suites - Town Lake

Purchase Order

Item Qty Unit Description of Supplies/Services Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1 1 ea Table Rental (20 -25 tables) (20x$15.00 + $85 Electric) -$                           -$                           385.00$               385.00$               -$                    -$                                             -$                      -$                 
1a 1 ea Table Rental (20 - 25 tables)  (Maximum $300) 300.00$                      300.00$                      -$                    -$                    -$                    -$                                             -$                      -$                 
1b 1 ea Table Rental (20 - 25 tables)  (Maximum $300) - No Charge* -$                           -$                           -$                    -$                    -$                    
2 1 ea Room Rental 5,000.00$                   5,000.00$                   1,000.00$            1,000.00$            3,000.00$           3,000.00$                                    -$                      -$                 
2a 1 ea Room Rental (Waived with $9,000 F&B minimum)** -$                           -$                           -$                    -$                    -$                    -$                                             -$                      -$                 

410.00$                                       2,750.00$              2,750.00$         3 1 ea Stage, Podium and A/V Serrvices 585.00$                      585.00$                      
24.00$                 16,800.00$          22.50$                

1,506.00$            1,506.00$            410.00$              
15,750.00$                                  18,900.00$       4a 700 ea Catering per person:  BREAKFAST BUFFET 21.00$                        14,700.00$                 

5 700 ea Parking per vehicle -$                           -$                           5.00$                   3,500.00$            -$                    -$                                             -$                      -$                 
$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

Buyer Name:
Recommend Award to:  

Contract Type  and        
Contract Number:

5a 700 ea Parking per vehicle (Discounted) 3.00$                          2,100.00$                   -$                    -$                    -$                    -$                                             -$                      -$                 

6 1 ea Service Charge - 21% 4,763.85$                   4,763.85$                   -$                    -$                    -$                    -$                                             4,546.50$              4,546.50$         
6a 1 ea Service Charge - 22% -$                           -$                           5,102.02$            5,102.02$            4,215.20$           4,215.20$                                    -$                      -$                 

-$                           -$                           -$                    -$                    -$                    -$                                             -$                      -$                 
-$                           -$                           -$                    -$                    -$                    -$                                             -$                      -$                 
-$                           -$                           -$                    -$                    -$                    -$                                             -$                      -$                 
-$                           -$                           -$                    -$                    -$                                             -$                      -$                 

Labor or Special Handling Charges (Stairs, inside Del, etc)
Transportation

-$                    

28,293.02$          GRAND TOTAL 27,448.85$                 

   
 *No Charge for Tables

**Rental Waived with Minimum (Food $18K) 

 *No Charge for Tables
**Rental Waived with Minimum
Self-Parking (Lot Limit = 500)    

23,375.20$                                  26,196.50$       

PO
Approved By (Typed 
Name and signature): Reed Stoddard, Purchasing Manager

Date Order Placed

Carol Crader

(Bid Tab must be approved by 
Purchasing Manager if award is 
made to other than low bidder 
or is a single source award)

Date: 4/30/09

SUBTOTAL 22,685.00$                 23,191.00$          19,160.00$                                  21,650.00$       

Bid Tab IFB #971-09031CC Rev2A-General Assembly.xls
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Amount

Bid Tabulation
PAGE ONE OF TWO

IFB # 971-09031CC Special Events Catering & Room Rental - General Assembly 2010

Bid Type (check one) Bidder Information 1 2 3 4
Name  Hyatt Regency - Austin Hilton - Austin Renaissance Austin Hotel Hyatt Regency Lost Pines Resort

Written Address 208 Barton Springs 500 East 4th Street 9721 Arboretum Blvd. 575 Hyatt Lost Pines Road
Verbal City, State, ZIP Austin, TX 78704 Austin, TX 78701 Austin, TX 78759 Lost Pines, TX 78612
Competitive POC NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sole/Single Source Email address:  jbusby@hyatt.com jyll.vertuno@hilton.com lyn.eckhardt@renaissancehotels liz.sansom@hyatt.com

Telephone # 512-480-2046 512-682-2718 512-795-6013 512-308-1234

Contract Type (check one) GENERAL ASSEMBLY 2010
Continental Breakfast Selection

BPO

Purchase Order
Contract

Amount Unit Price AmountItem Qty Unit Description of Supplies/Services Unit Price Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1 1 ea Table Rental (20 - 25 tables)  (Maximum $300) - No Charge* -$                     -$                     

-$                     -$                     2 1 ea Room Rental
2a 1 ea Room Rental (Waived with $9,500 F&B minimum)** -$                     -$                     

2,750.00$             3 1 ea Stage, Podium and A/V Serrvices 2,750.00$            
19.00$                 13,300.00$           4 700 ea Catering per person: CONTINENTAL BREAKFAST

-$                     -$                     5 700 ea Parking per vehicle
16 050 00$           SUBTOTAL

5

NO BID

Unit Price

Doubletree Austin
Omni Austin - Southpark

Sheraton Austin - Downtown
Embassy Suites - Austin Centra

Embassy Suites - Town Lake

Buyer Name:

16,050.00$           
6 1 ea Service Charge - 21% 

SUBTOTAL
3,370.50$            3,370.50$             

-$                     -$                     
-$                     -$                     
-$                     -$                     
-$                     -$                     

Transportation
Labor or Special Handling Charges (Stairs, inside Del, etc)

GRAND TOTAL -$                     

Contract Type  and     
Contract Number: PO

Approved By (Typed 
Name and signature):

Reed Stoddard, Purchasing 
Manager

19,420.50$           -$                     -$                     

Date Order Placed

Carol Cra

(Bid Tab must be approved by 
Purchasing Manager if award is 
made to other than low bidder or 

is a single source award)

Date: 4/30/09
Recommend Award to:

      

 *No Charge for Tables
**Rental Waived with Minimum
Self-Parking (Lot Limit = 500) 

Bid Tab IFB #971-09031CC Rev2A-General Assembly.xls
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Bid Tabulation
IFB # 971-09031CC Special Events Catering & Room Rental - General Assembly 2010 
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Bid Type (check one) Bidder Information 1 2 3 4 5

575 Hyatt Lost Pines Road Omni Austin - Southpark
Name  Hyatt Regency - Austin Hilton - Austin Renaissance Austin Hotel Hyatt Regency Lost Pines Resort

Austin, TX 78704 Austin, TX 78701 Austin, TX 78759 Lost Pines, TX 78612

Doubletree Austin
Written Address 208 Barton Springs 500 East 4th Street 9721 Arboretum Blvd.

Sheraton Austin - Downtown
Competitive POC Embassy Suites - Austin Central
Verbal City, State, ZIP

NO BID
Sole/Single Source Email address:  jbusby@hyatt.com jyll.vertuno@hilton.com yn.eckhardt@renaissancehotels liz.sansom@hyatt.com

Telephone # 512-480-2046 512-682-2705 512-795-6013 512-308-1234

Contract Type (check one) GENERAL ASSEMBLY 2010
Breakfast Buffet Selection

BPO

Purchase Order
Contract

Item Qty Unit Description of Supplies/Services Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1 1 ea Table Rental (20 - 25 tables)  (Maximum $300) - No Charge* -$                        -$                  
2 1 ea Room Rental -$                        -$                  
2a 1 ea Room Rental (Waived with $9,500 F&B minimum)** -$                        -$                  
3 1 ea Stage, Podium and A/V Serrvices 2,750.00$               2,750.00$         
4 700 ea Catering per person:  BREAKFAST BUFFET 28.00$                    19,600.00$       
5 700 ea Parking per vehicle -$                        -$                  

Embassy Suites - Town Lake

Buyer Name:

g p
SUBTOTAL 22,350.00$       

6 1 ea Service Charge - 21% 4,693.50$               4,693.50$         
-$                        -$                  
-$                        -$                  
-$                        -$                  
-$                        -$                  

Labor or Special Handling Charges (Stairs, inside Del, etc)
Transportation

GRAND TOTAL 

      

 *No Charge for Tables
**Rental Waived with Minimum
Self-Parking (Lot Limit = 500) 

27,043.50$       

Carol Crad

(Bid Tab must be approved by 
Purchasing Manager if award is 
made to other than low bidder or 

is a single source award)

Date: 4/30/09
Recommend Award to:  

Contract Type  and     
Contract Number: PO

Approved By (Typed 
Name and signature):

Reed Stoddard, Purchasing 
Manager

Date Order Placed
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