Bid Tabulation

IFB No. 966-10025AN Public Opening 22 July 2010 2:00 PM Ava Nelson, ACC Buyer

Vendor Information:
Name:

Address:

City, State, Zip

POC

Email Address:

Telephone #:

Qty

Item Unit

Description

SERVICES: PRINTING ACC COLLEGE CATALOG
|

1

Page One of One

2 3 4 5
Liberty Press United Graphics, Inc Shweiki Media West lishing C Data Rep! Corp.
1180 N. Mountain Spring Pkey 2916 Marshall Ave. 2520 Longview St. #315 610 opperman Drive 4545 Lane

Springville, UT 84663

Mattoon, 11 61938

San Antonio, TX 78218

Eagan, MN 55123

Auburn Hills, MI 48326

rpayne@libertypress.org
800-296-6402

stan-freeman@unitedgraphicsinc.com

217-235-7161

dreimherr@shweiki.com
512-480-0860

ellen.gillespie@thomsonreuters.com

651-687-5888

kellydatarepro@aol.com
919-845-0955

Vendor Information:
Name:

Address:

City, state, Zip

PoC

Email Address:

Telephone #:

aty

Item Unit

Description

1 ACC College Catalog (option 1)
15,000 | EA |Gloss UV (or Equal)

Base Price S 41,720.00 S 32,521.51 S 44,305.00 No Bid S 1.85
Price (Plus 8 Pages) $ 541.00 $ 33,063.64 $ 44,974.00 No Bid $ 1.82
Price (Minus 8 pages) 960.00 31,677.07 43,187.00 No Bid 1.88

2 | 15,000 | EA [ACC College Catalog (option 2)
Gloss Aqueous (or Equal)
Base Price No Bid 32,252.89 No Bid 30,000.00 No Bid
Price (Plus 8 Pages) No Bid $ 32,795.02 No Bid $ 469.52 No Bid
Price (Minus 8 pages) No Bid S 31,408.45 No Bid S 469.52 No Bid

RR Donnelley

Phillips Brothers Printers

Darby Printing Company

The P.A. Hutchison Company

Creasey Printing Services

3410 Far West Blvd Ste #150

2309 West White Oaks Dr

6215 Purdue Drive

400 Penn Avenue

2700 W. Lawrence Ave, Ste H

Austin, TX 78731

springfield, IL 62704

Atlanta, GA 30336

Mayfield, PA 18433

springfield, IL 62704

Paul Roinson

Carolyn Rush

Bob Cleary

Tony Kniolek

Kelli Lynch

1

ACC College Catalog (option 1)

15,000 | EA

Gloss UV (or Equal)

carolyn@pbpweb.com
217-787-3014

bcleary@darbyprinting.com

800-241-5292x240

info@creaseyprinting.com

217-787-1055

2 | 15,000 | EA

ACC College Catalog (option 2)

Gloss Aqueous (or Equal)

Base Price

No Bid

38,

873.00

Base Price S 31,871.00 S 39,782.00 each $ 1.74 S 27,792.00 S 29,414.00
Price (Plus 8 Pages) S 31,928.00 S 734.00 each $ 0.05 $ 28,406.00 $ 350.00
Price (Minus 8 pages) 29,683.00 520.00 each 0.02 27,032.00 350.00

Vendor Information:
Name:

Address:

City, State, Zip

POC

Email Address:

Telephone #:

Item Qty Unit

Description

each 1.74 27,040.00 29,414.00
Price (Plus 8 Pages) No Bid S 734.00 each $ 0.05 $ 27,654.00 $ 350.00
Price (Minus 8 pages) No Bid S 520.00 each S 0.02 S 26,279.00 S 350.00

Ginny's Printing

Cenveo San Antonio

8410 tuscany Way

5101 S. Zarazamora

Austin, TX 78641

San Antonio, TX 78211

Eric Fisher

Simon J. Esparza Il

efisher@ginnysprintung.com
512-483-6101

1

ACC College Catalog (option 1)

15,000 | EA

Gloss UV (or Equal)

Base Price

45,105.58

simon.esparza@cenveo.com

210-923-7591

47,276.00

Price (Plus 8 Pages)

$ 46,650.37

$ 47,986.00

2 | 15,000 | EA

Price (Minus 8 pages)
ACC College Catalog (option 2)

44,800.71

Gloss Aqueous (or Equal)

46,195.00

Base Price 44,290.89 46,626.00
Price (Plus 8 Pages) $ 45,831.68 $ 47,356.00
Price (Minus 8 pages) $ 43,986.81 $ 45,545.00
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