BID TABULATION: Bid Opening November 10, 2011; 2:00pm 4 Pages
IFB 895-12008RW: District-Wide Welding Department Materials and Consumable Supplies
Round Rock Alamo Midwest
Welding Welding Tecnology
Supply Supply Products
ITEM NO BID
SMAW Electrodes - 50 Ib Tins: Price Price Price
E 7018 3/32" - Murex S 84.50 N/A
E 7018 1/8" - Murex $ 80.00 N/A
E 7018 5/32" - Murex S 79.50 N/A
E 6010 1/8" - Lincoln Fleetweld 5P+ S 118.00] 135.00
E 6010 3/32" - Lincoln Fleetweld 5P+ S 128.00] $ 145.00
E 6010 5/32" - Lincoln Fleetweld 5P+ $ 115.00] $ 132.50
E 6010 3/16" - Lincoln Fleetweld 5P+ S 112.00| $ 130.00
Total:| $ 717.00] $ 542.50
GTAW/Oxy Fuel Filler Rod 10 Ibs Containers Price Price Price
RG 45 1/16" - Weldcote S 14.10] $ 24.50
RG 45 3/32" - Weldcote S 13.30| S 23.50
RG 45 1/8" - Weldcote S 13.00] $ 23.00
ER 70S-2 1/16" - Weldcote S 23.80] S 31.00
ER 70S-2 3/32" - Weldcote $ 23.00] S 27.00
ER 70S-2 1/8" - Weldcote S 22.00] S 26.50
ER 308L 1/16" - Weldcote S 44.60| S 67.50
ER 308L 3/32" - Weldcote S 42.80] S 66.00
ER 308L 1/8" - Weldcote S 41.90| $ 67.00
R 4043 1/16" - Weldcote S 38.90] S 58.00
R 4043 3/32" - Weldcote S 34.70| S 54.00
R 4043 1/8" - Weldcote S 34.10] S 55.00
LFB 1/16" - Weldcote S 64.90| $ 82.50
LFB 3/32" - Weldcote S 64.50| S 80.00
LFB 1/8" - Weldcote S 64.10| S 81.00
.045 ss ER316L - Weldcote S 61.80] S 92.50
Total:| $ 602.30| $ 859.00
GMAW/FCAW Wire Spools 33lb: Price Price Price
.035" (ER705-6) Solid - Weldcote S 3432 $ 42.90
.045" (ER705-6) Solid - Weldcote S 33.66] S 42.90
.035" (E71T-11) Cored - Weldcote S 90.00] S 115.50
.045" (E71T-11) Cored - Weldcote S 136.84| S 106.15
.045" (E71T-1) Cored - Weldcote S 56.10 N/A
Total:| $ 350.92| S 307.45




BID TABULATION: Bid Opening November 10, 2011; 2:00pm 4 Pages
IFB 895-12008RW: District-Wide Welding Department Materials and Consumable Supplies

Round Rock |Alamo Midwest
Welding Welding Tecnology
Supply Supply Products
ITEM NO BID
GMAW Wire Spools 16 Ib: Price Price Price
.035" Aluminum 4043 - Radnor S 64.80| S 88.00
3/64" Aluminum 4043 - Radnor S 59.20| $ 92.00
.035" Aluminum 5356 - Radnor S 66.72| S 93.60
3/64" Aluminum 5356 - Radnor S 61.76] S 92.00
Total:] $ 252.48| $ 365.60
Oxy Fuel Filler Rod 50 Ibs Cartons Price Price Price
RG 45 1/16" - ESAB All-State Part # 69710212 S 215.40 N/A
RG 45 3/32" - ESAB All-State Part # 69710214 S 131.10 N/A
RG 45 1/8" - ESAB All-State Part # 69710216 S 65.00 N/A
Total] S 441.20 N/A
GTAW Filler Rod 30 Ibs Cartons with 2 Flags Price Price Price
ER 70S-2 1/16" - ESAB Spool Arc 65 Part # 1041F08 S 232.50 N/A
ER 70S-2 3/32" - ESAB Spool Arc 65 Part # 1041F10 S 182.50 N/A
ER 70S-2 1/8" - ESAB Spool Arc 65 Part # 1041F12 S 180.00 N/A
Total:| S 595.00 N/A
GTAW Filler Rod 30 Ibs Cartons Price Price Price
ER 308L 1/16" - ESAB Arcaloy Part # 256011834 S 217.80 N/A
ER 308L 3/32" - ESAB Arcaloy Part # 256011842 S 205.50 N/A
ER 308L 1/8" - ESAB Arcaloy Part # 256011859 S 203.10 N/A
ER316L - .045" - ESAB Arcaloy Part # 258176155 S 125.70 N/A
Total: S 752.10 N/A
GTAW Filler Rod 33 Ibs Cartons Price Price Price
R 4043 1/16" - ESAB Alcotec Part # 404336062 S 105.27 N/A
R 4043 3/32" - ESAB Alcotec Part # 404336094 S 102.30 N/A
R 4043 1/8" - ESAB Alcotec Part # 404336125 S 101.64 N/A
Total:| S 309.21 N/A
Low Fuming Bronze Filler Rod 10 Ibs Cartons Price Price Price
LFB 1/16" - ESAB All-State Part # 69063000 S 139.40 N/A
LFB 3/32" - ESAB All-State Part # 69063001 S 113.00 N/A
LFB 1/8" - ESAB All-State Part # 69063002 S 115.70 N/A
Total:| S 368.10 N/A




BID TABULATION: Bid Opening November 10, 2011; 2:00pm 4 Pages
IFB 895-12008RW: District-Wide Welding Department Materials and Consumable Supplies
Round Rock Alamo Midwest
Welding Welding Tecnology
Supply Supply Products
ITEM NO BID
GMAW/FCAW Wire Spools 33lb: Price Price Price
.035" (ER70S-6) Solid - ESAB Spool Arc 86 Part # 1388F05 $ 45.21 N/A
.045" (ER70S-6) Solid - ESAB Spool Arc 86 Part # 1388F07 S 44,55 N/A
.035" (E71T-11) Cored - ESAB Coreshield 11 Part # 242203503 S 124.41 N/A
.045" (E71T-11) Cored - ESAB Coreshield 11 Part # 242201408 S 89.10 N/A
.045" (E71T-1) Cored - ESAB Dualshield 710 X-M Part # 245019807 S 74.58 N/A
Total: S 377.85 N/A
GMAW Wire Spools 16 Ib: Price Price Price
.035" Aluminum 4043 - Alcotec Part # 404316035 S 64.80 N/A
3/64" Aluminum 4043 - Alcotec Part # 404316047 S 59.20 N/A
.035" Aluminum 5356 - Alcotec Part # 535616035 S 66.72 N/A
3/64" Aluminum 5356 - Alcotec Part # 535616047 S 61.76 N/A
Total:] S 252.48 N/A
Tungsten Electrodes 10 Pack: Price Price Price
2% C-eriated
1/16" - Best Weld $ 16.72 | $ 18.50
3/32" - Best Weld $ 33.65] S 27.50
1/8" - Best Weld $ 61.80 | $ 35.00
Pure
3/32" - Best Weld $ 2055 | $ 28.00
1/8" - Best Weld $ 35.38] S 38.50
1% Zirconiated
1/16" - Best Weld $ 1569 ] S 27.00
3/32" - Best Weld $ 3435 S 29.00
1/8" - Best Weld $ 56.56 | S 38.00
2% Thoriated
1/16" - Best Weld $ 10.60 ] S 19.50
3/32" - Best Weld $ 21.48] S 29.50
1/8" - Best Weld $ 37641 S 39.50
Total:] S 344.42| S 330.00
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IFB 895-12008RW: District-Wide Welding Department Materials and Consumable Supplies
Round Rock Alamo Midwest
Welding Welding Tecnology
Supply Supply Products
ITEM NO BID

Delivery Charges, Surcharges, and any other Applicable Price

Charges: Please list all.

*Delivery Charge* S 895 S 9.50

*Fuel Charge* S - S -

*HazMat Charge* S - S -

Total $ 8.95] $ 9.50

END END END END

Rodney Wheeler, Construction Buyer
Alex Rivera, Purchasing Assistant
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